101 ARCH STREET BOSTON, MA 02110 (617) 556-0007

INVOICE NO. 111627

BOARD OF SELECTMEN TOWNSEND TOWN HALL 272 MAIN STREET TOWNSEND, MA 01469

A	PR	11	25.	20	17

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH March 31, 2017

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

GENERALL	EGAL SER	VICES		
3/1/2017	LFG	RECALL - REVIEW AND REPLY TO E-MAIL FROM TOWN CLERK RE: RECEIPT OF SUFFICIENT SIGNATURES FOR RECALL PETITIONS TO BE PREPARED.	0.20	32.00
3/2/2017	BWR	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN A DMINISTRATOR AND LEGAL RESEARCH RE: RESPONSES TO RECORDS REQUEST - EXECUTIVE SESSION MINUTES/RECORDINGS AND MEETING RECORDS; DRAFT RESPONSES.	1.30	208.00
3/3/2017	LFG	RECALL - REVIEW FACTS AND LEGAL ISSUES RE: FORM OF PETITIONED ARTICLES.	0.20	32.00
3/3/2017	BWR	RESEARCH AND DRAFT OPINION LETTER TO TOWN ADMINISTRATOR RE: FURTHER RECORDS REQUESTS FOR EXECUTIVE SESSION RECORDS AND APPLICABLE EXEMPTIONS	0.80	128.00
3/6/2017	LFG	RECALL - REVIEW AND REPLY TO E-MAILS FROM TOWN CLERK RE: ISSUES CONCERNING FORM OF PETITIONS.	0.60	96.00
3/7/2017	LFG	TOWN MEETING - REVIEW FACTS AND LEGAL ISSUES RE: PETITIONED ARTICLES AND IMPLICATIONS THEREOF.	0.20	32.00
3/7/2017	DCJ	SPECIAL TOWN MEETING - REVIEW STATUS OF SPECIAL TOWN MEETING; E-MAIL TOWN ADMINISTRATOR.	0.10	16.00
3/13/2017	LFG	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN MANAGER AND ANALYZE FACTS AND LEGAL ISSUES RE: PROCESS FOR HOLDING MEETING TO APPROVE AND POST WARRANT IN LIGHT OF WEATHER EMERGENCY.	0.90	144.00
3/13/2017	BWR	EXCHANGE EMAILS WITH PLANNING AND ZONING ADMINISTRATOR RE: DRAFT BY-LAWS; REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENT ON DRAFT ZONING BY-LAW AMENDMENTS RE: MEDICAL MARIJUANA FACILITIES AND LARGE SCALE SOLAR FACILITIES.	3.50	560.00

3/15/2017	JBB	TRANSFORMATIONS, INC ANALYZE EFFECT OF FORECLOSURE ON COMPREHENSIVE PERMIT AND POTENTIAL CHANGES TO SAME.	0.20	32.00
3/15/2017	BWR	REVIEW OPEN MEETING LAW COMPLAINT AGAINST BOARD OF SELECTMEN (LECUYER) AND ANALYZE BASIS FOR RESPONSE.	0.80	128.00
3/15/2017	BWR	LEGAL ANALYSIS RE: PROPOSED ZONING BY-LAW AMENDMENTS - MULTI-FAMILY DEVELOPMENT, ACCESSORY APARTMENTS.	0.60	96.00
3/15/2017	BWR	LEGAL ANALYSIS RE: PUBLIC RECORDS REQUEST - SALARY PAID TO EMPLOYEES ON ADMINISTRATIVE LEAVE.	0.90	144.00
3/16/2017	BWR	REVIEW TOWN'S RECALL SPECIAL ACT AND GENERAL LAWS RE: BALLOT QUESTION; DRAFT BALLOT QUESTION AND CORRESPONDENCE TO TOWN CLERK RE: SAME.	1.30	208.00
3/17/2017	DCJ	WATER - REVIEW PRIOR OPINION LETTERS; DRAFT RESPONSE TO COMPLAINT LETTER.	2.00	320.00
3/17/2017	BWR	REVIEW PENDING CASES AND DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO TREASURER RE: FYI6 AUDIT.	0.80	128.00
3/17/2017	BWR	OPEN MEETING LAW COMPLAINT (LECUYER) - LEGAL RESEARCH AND DRAFT RESPONSE RE: NO VIOLATION FOR DECLINING TO HOLD MEETING IN LARGER ROOM	1.00	160.00
3/17/2017	BWR	DRAFT BALLOT QUESTION RE: PROPOSED CHARTER AMENDMENT - INCREASE SIZE OF BOARD OF SELECTMEN	0.40	64.00
3/17/2017	BWR	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN A DMINISTRATOR RE: RECORDS REQUEST (KELLY) FOR CHIEF'S AUDIO RECORDING; LEGAL ANALYSIS AND DRAFT RESPONSE TO REQUEST CITING EXEMPTIONS	1.50	240.00
3/20/2017	LFG	REVIEW WARRANT AS TO FORM.	0.30	48.00
3/20/2017	BWR	REVIEW SPECIAL TOWN MEETING ARTICLES.	0.40	64.00
3/20/2017	BWR	RECORDS REQUEST FOR "PARKER REPORT" - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN ADMINISTRATOR RE: DRAFTING RESPONSE TO REQUESTER ASSERTING EXEMPTIONS; REVIEW REPORT AND CITE POTENTIAL EXEMPTIONS.	4.10	656.00
3/20/2017	BWR	OPEN MEETING LAW COMPLAINT (LECUYER) A GAINST BOARD OF SELECTMEN - LEGAL RESEARCH AND DRAFT RESPONSE; RESEARCH ATTORNEY GENERAL	3.10	496.00

DETERMINATIONS ON SIMILAR ISSUES.

.3/21/2017	BWR	RECORDS REQUEST FOR "PARKER REPORT" - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN ADMINISTRATOR AND REVIEW REDACTIONS IN REPORT BEFORE PRODUCING.	1.40	224.00
3/21/2017	BWR	LEGAL RESEARCH AND ANALYSIS RE: SPECIAL TOWN MEETING ARTICLES	1.50	240.00
3/22/2017	LFG	LEGAL RESEARCH AND E-MAIL TOWN ADMINISTRATOR RE: TIMING FOR CONSIDERATION OF RECALL QUESTIONS.	0.60	96.00
3/22/2017	KLK	TOWN MEETING - ANALYZE WARRANT ARTICLES RE: CENTRAL FIRE STATION EASEMENT AND SALE OF VACANT REAL ESTATE PURSUANT TO REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (TODD DRIVE).	0.50	80.00
3/22/2017	MER	ANALYZE POTENTIAL RESPONSE TO PENDING PUBLIC RECORDS REQUEST FROM INDIVIDUAL WITH LAWSUIT AGAINST TOWN.	0.10	16.00
3/22/2017	BWR	LEGAL REVIEW AND ANALYSIS RE: PUBLIC RECORDS REQUEST - COUNSEL FOR FORMER EMPLOYEE WITH PENDING MASSACHUSETTS COMMISSION AGAINST DISCRIMINATION COMPLAINT	0.60	96.00
3/23/2017	DCJ	TOWN HALL - REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM INSURANCE COUNSEL RE: DOCUMENT PRODUCTION.	0.20	32.00
3/23/2017	BWR	DRAFT RESPONSE TO RECORDS REQUEST RE: FORMER EMPLOYEE WITH PENDING MASSACHUSETTS COMMISSION A GAINST DISCRIMINATION COMPLAINT; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO INSURANCE COUNSEL RE: SAME	1.80	288.00
3/24/2017	KLK	TOWN MEETING - ANALYZE REAL ESTATE WARRANT ARTICLES, INCLUDING ARTICLE RE: DISPOSITION OF TODD DRIVE PROPERTY.	0.40	64.00
3/28/2017	LFG	PREPARE FOR TOWN MEETING.	0.30	48.00
		SUBTOTAL:	32.60	5,216.00
GENERAL LA	BOR SERV	ICES		
3/3/2017	DCJ	E-MAIL CHAIR BOARD OF SELECTMEN WITH INVESTIGATIVE REPORT.	0.10	16.00
3/6/2017	DCJ	POLICE - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SUPERVISOR OF PUBLIC RECORDS RE: RESPONSE TO DOCUMENT REQUEST.	0.10	16.00

3/7/2017	DC1	POLICE - E-MAIL PROPOSED HEARING OFFICER RE: A SSIGNMENT; REVIEW RESPONSE; FORWARD TO TOWN A DMINISTRATOR.	0.10	16.00
3/7/2017	DCJ	WATER - REVIEW E-MAIL WITH ATTACHED DEMAND LETTER; REVIEW PRIOR OPINION RE: AUTHORITY OF BOARD OF SELECTMEN OVER EMPLOYEES.	0.60	96.00
3/7/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN A DMINISTRA TOR RE: EXECUTIVE SESSION NOTICE.	0.10	16.00
3/7/2017	DCJ	POLICE - REVIEW E-MAIL FROM TOWN ADMINISTRATOR WITH FINAL NOTICE OF EXECUTIVE SESSION.	0.10	16.00
3/7/2017	DCJ	WATER - REVIEW STATUS OF PERMISSIVE LEGISLATION RE: WATER DEPARTMENT.	0.20	32.00
3/8/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH EMPLOYEE COUNSEL RE: TOWN RECEIPT OF REPORT AND EXECUTIVE SESSION; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN ADMINISTRATOR RE: SAME.	0.30	48.00
3/9/2017	DCJ	POLICE - E-MAIL HEARING OFFICER; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PRIVATE ATTORNEY; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN ADMINISTRATOR RE: STATUS.	0.30	48.00
		SUBTOTAL:	1.90	304.00
CABLETV		SUBTOTAL:		304.00
CABLETV 3/20/2017	WH	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM CABLE ADVISORY COMMITTEE RE: LINE EXTENSION ISSUES; REVIEW CURRENT COMCAST LICENSE; REPLY TO E-MAILS RELATING TO LINE EXTENSION.		304.00
	WH	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM CABLE ADVISORY COMMITTEE RE: LINE EXTENSION ISSUES; REVIEW CURRENT COMCAST LICENSE; REPLY TO E-MAILS RELATING TO	1.90	
3/20/2017		REVIEW E-MAIL FROM CABLE ADVISORY COMMITTEE RE: LINE EXTENSION ISSUES; REVIEW CURRENT COMCAST LICENSE; REPLY TO E-MAILS RELATING TO LINE EXTENSION.	0.40	64.00
3/20/2017		REVIEW E-MAIL FROM CABLE ADVISORY COMMITTEE RE: LINE EXTENSION ISSUES; REVIEW CURRENT COMCAST LICENSE; REPLY TO E-MAILS RELATING TO LINE EXTENSION. SUBTOTAL:	0.40	64.00
3/20/2017 CENTRAL FI	RE STATIO	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM CABLE ADVISORY COMMITTEE RE: LINE EXTENSION ISSUES; REVIEW CURRENT COMCAST LICENSE; REPLY TO E-MAILS RELATING TO LINE EXTENSION. SUBTOTAL: ON EASEMENT E-MAIL OPPOSING COUNSEL REQUESTING INTERVIEW	0.40	64.00
3/20/2017 CENTRAL FI	RE STATIO DCJ	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM CABLE ADVISORY COMMITTEE RE: LINE EXTENSION ISSUES; REVIEW CURRENT COMCAST LICENSE; REPLY TO E-MAILS RELATING TO LINE EXTENSION. SUBTOTAL: ON EASEMENT E-MAIL OPPOSING COUNSEL REQUESTING INTERVIEW DATE AND MEDICAL NOTE.	0.40	64.00

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN ADMINISTRATOR.

		ADMINISTRATOR.		
3/12/2017	DCJ	REVIEW E-MAILS; E-MAIL TOWN ADMINISTRATOR WITH DOCUMENTS REQUESTED.	0.20	32.00
3/12/2017	DCJ	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM TOWN ADMINISTRATOR TO POLICE LIEUTENANT RE:TOWN REQUEST FOR COMPUTER INFORMATION.	0.10	16.00
3/14/2017	DCJ	E-MAIL CHIEF'S COUNSEL RE: INTERVIEW.	0.20	32.00
3/15/2017	DCJ	TWO TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH EMPLOYEE COUNSEL RE: INTERVIEW AND TOWN REQUEST FOR DOCUMENTS; TWO E-MAILS TO COUNSEL WITH REQUESTED DOCUMENTS.	0.70	112.00
3/16/2017	DCJ	DRAFT LETTER TO OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: INTERVIEW; REVIEW REPLY WITH MEDICAL NOTE; FORWARD TO TOWN ADMINISTRATOR.	0.30	48.00
3/17/2017	DCJ	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: INTERVIEW; FORWARD TO TOWN ADMINISTRATOR.	0.10	16.00
3/19/2017	DCJ	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: INTERVIEW.	0.10	16.00
3/22/2017	DCJ	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM CJIS RE: INVESTIGATION.	0.10	16.00
3/27/2017	DCJ	REVIEW DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR INTERVIEW.	1.00	160.00
3/29/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN A DMINISTRATOR AND BOARD OF SELECTMEN RE: STATUS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: RESOLUTION.	0.50	80.00
3/31/2017	DCJ	DRAFT E-MAIL TO TOWN ADMINISTRATOR RE: INFORMATION NEEDED FOR INVESTIGATION.	0.10	16.00
		SUBTOTAL:	3.50	560.00
POLICE / BOF	PINVESTI	GATION		
3/3/2017	DCJ	E-MAIL DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY RE: CJIS FAILURE TO RESPOND.	0.20	32.00
3/7/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN ADMINISTRATOR RE: STATUS OF INVESTIGATION.	0.60	96.00

3/10/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN A DMINISTRATOR RE: CONTACT BY A GENCY ATTORNEY.	0.10	16.00
3/13/2017	DCJ	PREPARE FOR AND CONDUCT TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CJIS.	0.70	112.00
3/16/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN A DMINISTRATOR RE: STATUS.	0.10	16.00
3/16/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN A DMINISTRATOR RE- EXECUTIVE SESSION PROCEDURE.	0.20	32.00
3/21/2017	DCJ	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CJIS; FORWARD TO TOWN ADMINISTRATOR.	0.20	32.00
3/21/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN A DMINISTRATOR RE: CHIEF ATTENDANCE AT BOARD OF SELECTMEN MEETING.	0.10	16.00
3/22/2017	DCJ	REVIEW E-MAIL RE: CHIEF INTERVIEW; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHIEF RE: SAME.	0.20	32.00
3/24/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: INTERVIEW; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: INTERVIEW.	0.20	32.00
3/27/2017	DCJ	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM TOWN ADMINISTRATOR RE: STATUS OF CHIEF INTERVIEW.	0.10	16.00
3/28/2017	DCJ	PREPARE FOR INTERVIEW; CONDUCT INTERVIEW; TWO TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH TOWN A DMINISTRA TOR.	0.60	96.00
3/29/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN A DMINISTRATOR RE: CONTRACT RESOLUTION; EDIT SETTLEMENT A GREEMENT.	0.30	48.00
3/31/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL RESETTLEMENT POSSIBILITIES.	0.20	32.00
		SUBTOTAL:	3.80	608.00
RECALL ELEC	CTION AC	Т		
3/3/2017	BWR	RESEARCH AND DRAFT OPINION LETTER TO TOWN CLERK RE: PROVIDING FORM OF RECALL PETITIONS AND RELATED ISSUES.	0.40	64.00

		SUBTOTAL:	0.40	64.00
POLICE/GIA	ANCOTTI/	DISC.		
3/10/2017	DCJ	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM EMPLOYEE COUNSEL RE: REQUEST FOR INFORMATION; FORWARD TO TOWN ADMINISTRATOR; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN ADMINISTRATOR RE: A PPOINTMENT OF HEARING OFFICER.	0.10	16.00
3/12/2017	DCJ	REVIEW INVESTIGATOR REPORT; START PREPARATION OF NOTICE OF HEARING.	1.00	160.00
3/13/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH HO RE RETENTION OF SERVICES; E-MAIL TOWN ADMINISTRATOR RE: RETENTION LETTER.	0.20	32.00
3/14/2017	DCJ	DRAFT NOTICE OF HEARING.	1.00	160.00
3/15/2017	DCJ	E-MAIL TOWN ADMINISTRATOR RE: NOTICE.	0.10	16.00
3/16/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN A DMINISTRA TOR RE: STA TUS.	0.10	16.00
3/16/2017	DCJ	EDIT DISCIPLINE NOTICE; E-MAIL TOWN ADMINISTRATOR WITH NOTICE.	0.10	16.00
3/19/2017	DCJ	REDACT PARKER REPORT.	1.00	160.00
3/24/2017	DCJ	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM LIEUTENANT REQUESTING HEARING.	0.10	16.00
3/24/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: INFORMATION REQUEST.	0.20	32.00
3/27/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: DISCOVERY; E-MAIL INVESTIGATOR RE: TRANSCRIPTS.	0.30	48.00
3/28/2017	DCI	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM INVESTIGATOR WITH LIEUTENANT TRANSCRIPT; E-MAIL OPPOSING COUNSEL PRODUCING STATEMENT.	0.20	32.00
3/29/2017	DCJ	REVIEW CLARK TRANSCRIPT.	0.40	64.00
3/30/2017	MZK	REVIEW AND ANALYZE INVESTIGATIVE REPORT.	0.50	80.00
		SUBTOTAL:	5.30	848.00

COPPERSMITH WAY

3/7/2017	KLK	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: TRI-PARTY A GREEMENTS AND EXTENSIONS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ZONING AND PLANNING ADMINISTRATOR RE: OUTSTANDING WORK AT PROJECT, INCLUDING COMPLETION OF ROADS AND RELATED QUESTIONS IN LIGHT OF FORECLOSURE AUCTION.	1.00	160.00
3/8/2017	KLK	E-MAIL TO ZONING AND PLANNING ADMINISTRATOR RE: REQUEST FOR PAYMENTS UNDER TRI-PARTY A GREEMENTS; ANALYZE PHASE II TRI-PARTY A GREEMENT AND A MENDMENTS TO A GREEMENTS RE: PHASE I AND PHASE II SECURITY.	0.80	128.00
3/9/2017	KLK	A NA LYZE REGULA TORY A GREEMENT AND A MENDMENT THERETO.	0.20	32.00
3/13/2017	KLK	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A TTORNEY FOR FIDELITY BANK RE: OUTSTANDING TRI-PARTY A GREEMENTS AND MONIES DUE THEREUNDER; E-MAIL TO A TTORNEY FOR BANK SETTING FORTH CLAIMS UNDER TRI-PARTY A GREEMENTS FOR PHASES I AND 2; EXCHANGE E-MAIL WITH ZONING AND PLANNING A DMINISTRATOR RE: CLAIMS FOR OUTSTANDING MONIES.	1.20	192.00
3/15/2017	KLK	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: SURVIVAL OF 40B PERMITS.	0.40	64.00
3/16/2017	KLK	E-MAIL TO ZONING AND PLANNING ADMINISTRATOR RE: FORECLOSURE OF 40B DEVELOPMENT; E-MAIL TO ATTORNEY FOR FIDELITY BANK RE: MONIES UNDER TRI-PARTY A GREEMENT.	0.40	64.00
3/17/2017	KLK	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY FOR FIDELITY BANK RE: STATUS OF FORECLOSURE AND REQUEST FOR MONIES UNDER TRI-PARTY A GREEMENTS.	0.30	48.00
3/19/2017	KLK	DRAFT LETTER FOR ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS REQUESTING MONIES UNDER TRI-PARTY A GREEMENTS; E-MAIL TO ZONING AND PLANNING ADMINISTRATOR RE: PROPOSED LETTER.	0.70	112.00
3/20/2017	KLK	EXCHANGE E-MAIL WITH ZONING AND PLANNING ADMINISTRATOR RE: DEMAND ON DEVELOPER; REVISE PROPOSED LETTER FOR ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS TO SEND TO FIDELITY BANK.	0.40	64.00
3/22/2017	KLK	EXCHANGE E-MAIL WITH ZONING AND PLANNING ADMINISTRATOR RE: A CQUISITION OF PROPERTY BY BANK AND OBLIGATION TO COMPLETE ROADS.	0.20	32.00
3/29/2017	KLK	EXCHANGE E-MAIL WITH ZONING AND PLANNING ADMINISTRATOR RE: REQUEST FOR BOND MONIES AND	0.20	32.00

BANK'S OBLIGATION TO COMPLETE ROADS.

		SUBTOTAL:	5.80	928.00
KING V. TO	WN CLERI	K, ET A L.		
3/27/2017	BWR	REVIEW ONLINE DOCKET RE: SELECTMAN'S COMPLAINT REGARDING RECALL PETITIONS; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO COUNSEL FOR PETITIONERS RE: STATUS OF COMPLAINT; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO TOWN CLERK RE: SAME	1.00	160.00
3/30/2017	BWR	REVIEW COMPLAINT AND LEGAL RESEARCH AND ANALYSIS RE: OPPOSITION TO PRELIMINARY INJUNCTION REQUEST.	1.10	176.00
3/31/2017	BWR	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: RECALL PETITIONS AND TOWN OFFICIALS ROLES.	3.80	608.00
		SUBTOTAL:	5.90	944.00
ANNUALTO	OWN MEET	TING		
3/19/2017	DCJ	REVIEW E-MAIL WITH POINT OF ORDER RE: PETITIONED ARTICLES.	0.20	32.00
3/24/2017	BWR	REVIEW SPECIAL TOWN MEETING ARTICLES FOR 3/28/17 MEETING; DRAFT MOTIONS FOR REVOLVING FUND AND SCHOOL RESOURCE OFFICER VOTES; RESEARCH AND DRAFT OPINION LETTER TO TOWN ADMINISTRATOR RE: ARTICLES.	2.10	336.00
3/26/2017	DCJ	REVIEW WARRANT ARTICLES; REVIEW TOWN MEETING TIME RE: ADVISING ARTICLES; REVIEW OPINIONS RE: ADVISING WARRANT ARTICLES.	0.50	80.00
3/27/2017	DCJ	REVIEW LETTER FROM CITIZEN ATTORNEY RE: SPECIAL TOWN MEETING FACILITIES; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN ADMINISTRATOR RE: SAME; STRATEGIZE RE: MODERATOR AUTHORITY.	0.60	96.00
3/27/2017	BWR	SPECIAL TOWN MEETING - REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM COUNSEL FOR PETITIONERS CHALLENGING SITE OF MEETING, OTHER ISSUES; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO COUNSEL IN RESPONSE TO SAME; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH TOWN ADMINISTRATOR RE: SPECIAL TOWN MEETING ISSUES; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MODERATOR RE: PETITIONED ARTICLES, OPTIONS TO HANDLE DELIBERATIONS AND VOTING ON ARTICLES: RESEARCH AND DRAFT OPINION LETTER TO MODERATOR RE: SAME.	4.30	688.00
3/28/2017	DCJ	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND SPECIAL TOWN MEETING.	6.50	1,040.00

		SUBTOTAL:	14.20	2,272.00
CONTRACT	S			
3/21/2017	SEM	VOICEMAIL FROM FIRE CHIEF; REVIEW AND ANALYZE LEASE TO PURCHASE A GREEMENT FOR FIRE CHIEF AND DRAFT OPINION OF COUNSEL REQUESTED.	1.50	240.00
3/23/2017	SEM	E-MAIL FROM FIRE CHIEF RE: OPINION OF COUNSEL; E-MAIL EXCHANGE WITH LESSOR'S COUNSEL RELATIVE TO KP'S OPINION LETTER; RE-DRAFT LETTER AND SEND TO LESSOR.	0.80	128.00
3/24/2017	SEM	E-MAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH LESSOR'S AGENT INCLUDING ELECTRONIC AND MAIL TRANSMISSION OF UPDATED OPINION OF COUNSEL; CONFIRM OPINION ACCEPTED WITH FIRE CHIEF	0.40	64.00
		SUBTOTAL:	2.70	432.00
		TOTAL:	76.70	12,272.00
A CCUMULA POSTA GE, TO	TED DISBU DLL CALLS	URSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPR S AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.	ESS MAIL, SPE	CIAL
		TOTAL COSTS:		

TOTAL COSTS:

348.21

TOTAL DUE:

12,620.21

KP LAW, P.C. 101 ARCH STREET BOSTON, MA 02110 (617) 556-0007

INVOICE NO. 112058

BOARD OF SELECTMEN TOWNSEND TOWN HALL 272 MAIN STREET TOWNSEND, MA 01469

MAY 24, 2017

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH A pril 30, 2017

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

4/3/2017	LFG	RECALL - REVIEW FACTS AND LEGAL ISSUES RE: CONFLICTS AND OTHER MATTERS IMPACTING STATUS OF RECALL PETITIONS AND ELECTION.	0.20	32.00
4/5/2017	AEK	COPPERSMITH WAY-REVIEW DRAFT LETTER TO BANK REQUIRING MONEY RETURNED TO TOWN AND RESERVING RIGHTS.	0.30	48.00
4/10/2017	JBB	VILLAGE AT PATRIOT COMMON/7 TROPHY A VENUE - DETAILED TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PLANNING A DMINISTRATOR WITH SEVERAL QUESTIONS RELATED TO HISTORY OF OPEN SPACE PRESERVATION DEVELOPMENT AND NEW OWNER'S REQUEST TO A MEND DECISION AND MOVE DRIVEW A Y LOCATION; REVIEW RELATED E-MAILS.	0.90	144.00
4/10/2017	RTH	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A GENT FOR BOARD OF HEALTH RE: REQUEST FOR LEGAL ASSISTANCE.	0.10	16.00
4/10/2017	BWR	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN ADMINISTRATOR AND LEGAL ANALYSIS RE: SEVERAL PUBLIC RECORDS REQUESTS.	0.70	112.00
4/11/2017	JBB	7 TROPHY A VENUE - REVIEW E-MAIL FROM PLANNING ADMINISTRATOR RE: NEW OWNER'S POSITION THAT NO PERMIT OR PERMIT A MENDMENT REQUIRED TO CHANGE DRIVEW AY LOCATION; BEGIN TO REVIEW BACKGROUND DOCUMENTS.	0.70	112.00
4/11/2017	DCJ	DOCUMENT REQUEST - REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM TOWN ADMINISTRATOR RE: PUBLIC DOCUMENT REQUEST.	0.20	32.00
4/11/2017	KSS	TROPHY A VE. CLUSTER DEVELOPMENT - LEGAL RESEARCH RE: WHETHER A CCESS TO LOT 7 IS A CONDITION OF ORIGINAL DECISION.	0.20	32.00
4/12/2017	BWR	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN	1.80	288.00

		A DMINISTRATOR AND DRAFT RESPONSE TO RECORDS REQUESTS RE: PARKER REPORT, AUDIO RECORDING.		
4/12/2017	KSS	TROPHY A VE. CLUSTER DEVELOPMENT - REVIEW ORIGINAL 2009 DECISION, 2013 A MENDED DECISION, CONSTRUCTION PERMITS AND LAND COURT DECISION.	3.30	528.00
4/14/2017	KSS	TROPHY A VE. CLUSTER DEVELOPMENT - DRAFT EMAIL ANALYSIS OF THE BOARD'S DECISIONS AND BINDING EFFECT OF FINDINGS.	3.20	512.00
4/19/2017	KSS	TROPHY A VE LEGAL RESEARCH AND REVIEW OF FOLLOW-UP QUESTIONS AND ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS RECEIVED FROM TOWN.	0.70	112.00
4/21/2017	BWR	RESEARCH AND DRAFT OPINION LETTER TO TOWN CLERK RE: PROCEDURES FOR RECALL ELECTION.	0.80	128.00
4/24/2017	DCJ	DOCUMENT REQUEST - REVIEW EMAIL REGARDING DOCUMENT REQUEST; STRATEGIZE REGARDING RESPONSE.	0.10	16.00
4/24/2017	BWR	REVIEW STATUS OF PUBLIC RECORDS REQUESTS.	0.60	96.00
4/25/2017	DCJ	DOCUMENT REQUESTS - REVIEW AND FORWARD EMAILS REGARDING PUBLIC DOCUMENT REQUESTS.	0.20	32.00
4/25/2017	BWR	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO TOWN CLERK RE: ANNUAL TOWN MEETING ISSUES.	0.30	48.00
4/26/2017	BWR	TOWN MEETING - EXCHANGE EMAILS WITH TOWN CLERK RE: WARRANTS AND POSTING; REVIEW WARRANTS.	0.80	128.00
4/27/2017	BWR	REVIEW ANNUAL TOWN MEETING, SPECIAL TOWN MEETING WARRANT ARTICLES; DRAFT MOTION RE: REVOLVING FUND BY-LAW.	2.30	368.00
4/28/2017	BWR	LEGAL ANALYSIS AND DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO TOWN CLERK RE: RECORDS REQUEST - PAYROLL INFORMATION.	0.60	96.00
		SUBTOTAL:	18.00	2.880.00
GENERA L LA	BOR SERV	TCES		
4/12/2017	MZK	ASSEMBLE DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION TO CJIS.	1.40	224.00
4/18/2017	JM	TOWN HALL - FINALIZE AND E-MAIL TO TOWN A DMINISTRATOR TOWN RESPONSE TO EMPLOYEE CONTESTING NOTICE OF DISCIPLINARY HEARING DATE.	0.50	80.00

4/27/2017	DCJ	TOWN HALL - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHAIR BOARD OF SELECTMEN REGARDING GENERAL STATUS.	0.10	16.00

		SUBTOTAL:	2.00	320.00
TRUSTEES	OF PINE RI	IDGE CONDO TRUST V. COVIELLO AND TOWNSEND		
4/4/2017	BWR	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL, REVIEW FILE RE: STATUS OF UNPAID TAXES.	0.40	64.00
		SUBTOTAL:	0.40	64.00
POLICE CHI	EF EATON			
4/2/2017	DCJ	DRA FT E-MAIL TO OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: EXECUTIVE SESSION.	0.10	16.00
4/2/2017	DCJ	PREPARE FOR REPRESENT TOWN AT HEARING.	8.00	1,280.00
4/3/2017	DCJ	PREPARE FOR AND REPRESENT TOWN AT HEARING.	8.00	1,280.00
4/4/2017	DCJ	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL WITH SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL; REVIEW PROPOSAL; FORWARD TO TOWN ADMINISTRATOR.	0.30	48.00
4/6/2017	DCJ	PREPARE FOR AND REPRESENT TOWN AT EXECUTIVE SESSION.	3.50	560.00
4/7/2017	DCJ	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM TOWN ADMINISTRATOR WITH NOTICE OF DISCIPLINE; FORWARD TO OPPOSING COUNSEL.	0.10	16.00
4/7/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN ADMINISTRATOR RE: STATUS.	0.40	64.00
4/10/2017	DCJ	REVIEW LETTER FROM STENOGRAPHER RE: TRANSCRIPT.	0.10	16.00
4/13/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: SETTLEMENT AND HEARING STATUS.	0.20	32.00
4/14/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN A DMINISTRATOR RE: HEARING STATUS.	0.20	32.00
4/14/2017	MZK	SEND DOCUMENTS TO CHIEF'S ATTORNEY.	0.50	80.00
4/15/2017	DCJ	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM TOWN ADMINISTRATOR WITH LETTER FROM POLICE CHIEF.	0.30	48.00

4/18/2017	DCJ	DRAFT LETTER TO OPPOSING COUNSEL REGARDING CONTINUANCE.	0.20	32.00
4/19/2017	DCJ	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL AND TOWN ADMINISTRATOR; TWO TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL; TWO TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH TOWN ADMINISTRATOR.	0.60	96.00
4/20/2017	DCJ	PREPARE EXHIBIT LIST AND ASSOCIATED DOCUMENTS FOR HEARING. EDIT STATEMENT OF FACTS.	7.00	1,120.00
4/20/2017	DCJ	PREPARE FOR HEARING; ARRANGE EXHIBITS.	4.00	640.00
4/21/2017	DCJ	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND DISCIPLINE HEARING.	7.60	1,216.00
4/24/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN A DMINISTRA TOR REGARDING STA TUTE.	0.10	16.00
4/26/2017	DCJ	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL REGARDING NOTICE TO CHIEF.	0.10	16.00
		SUBTOTAL:	41.30	6,608.00
POLICE / BO	P INVESTI	GA TION		
4/11/2017	DCJ	DRAFT LETTER TO CJIS.	0.60	96.00
		SUBTOTAL:	0.60	96.00
RECALL ELE	CTION A C	Т		
4/23/2017	BWR	DRAFT FORM OF BALLOT FOR RECALL ELECTION; RESEARCH AND DRAFT OPINION LETTER TO TOWN CLERK RE: BALLOT AND OTHER ELECTION ISSUES.	1.50	240.00
		SUBTOTAL:	1.50	240.00
POLICE/GIAN	COTTI/DI	SC.		
4/2/2017	DCJ	REVIEW SMART INTERVIEW IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING.	0.20	32.00
4/6/2017	MZK	E-MAIL WITH COUNSEL AND HEARING OFFICER RE: SCHEDULING; REVIEW AND ANALYZE FILE IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING; CALLS TO COUNSEL AND HEARING OFFICER RE: DATE.	0.80	128.00

4/7/2017	MZK	E-MAIL WITH COUNSEL AND HEARING OFFICER RE: SCHEDULING.	0.10	16.00
4/11/2017	MZK	PREPARE FOR DISCIPLINARY HEARING; E-MAIL AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: DOCUMENTS.	1.00	160.00
4/12/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN A DMINISTRA TOR RE: HEARING STATUS.	0.30	48.00
4/12/2017	MZK	PREPARE FOR DISCIPLINARY HEARING.	1.70	272.00
4/12/2017	ВММ	BEGIN REVIEW OF INVESTIGATION REPORT TO PREPARE FOR HEARING WITH EMPLOYEE; REVIEW OPPOSING COUNSEL REQUEST FOR INFORMATION.	2.70	432.00
4/13/2017	DIE	REVIEW INVESTIGATION FILE RE: NOTES AND REPORT.	0.30	48.00
4/13/2017	MZK	PREPARE TOWN PRESENTATION FOR HEARING.	0.20	32.00
4/13/2017	ВММ	REVIEW OF INVESTIGATION REPORT TO PREPARE FOR HEARING; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: INFORMATION REQUEST; PREPARE PRESENTATION FOR HEARING BEFORE HEARING OFFICER.	5.80	928.00
4/14/2017	DIE	REVIEW FILE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL; DRAFT AFFIDA VIT FOR HEARING.	1.20	192.00
4/14/2017	MZK	PREPARE DOCUMENTS FOR DISCIPLINE HEARING.	4.70	752.00
4/14/2017	ВММ	OUTLINE PRESENTATION FOR TUESDAY HEARING; PREPARE DOCUMENTS FOR HEARING.	4.10	656.00
4/18/2017	MZK	ATTEND DISCIPLINARY HEARING.	7.50	1,200.00
4/18/2017	ВММ	PREPARE FOR AND REPRESENT TOWN AT SHOW CAUSE HEARING BEFORE HEARING OFFICER.	6.50	1,040.00
4/19/2017	DCJ	REVIEW EMAIL FROM TOWN ADMINISTRATOR WITH ATTACHED MEDICAL NOTE.	0.10	16.00
4/19/2017	MZK	PRODUCE UNREDACTED DOCUMENTS TO HEARING OFFICER; DRAFT POST HEARING BRIEF.	2.10	336.00
4/19/2017	ВММ	REVIEW NOTES FROM DISCIPLINARY HEARING BEFORE HEARING OFFICER; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH HEARING OFFICER AS TO EXHIBITS ENTERED DURING HEARING; REVIEW E-MAIL FROM HEARING OFFICER AS TO DELIVERY OF EXHIBITS TO OPPOSING COUNSEL.	0.80	128.00

4/21/2017	MZK	DRAFT POST HEARING BRIEF.	0.20	32.00
4/24/2017	MZK	DRAFT POST-HEARING BRIEF.	4.10	656.00
4/25/2017	ВММ	EXCHANGE E-MAILS WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL AND HEARING OFFICER RE: DUE DATE FOR POST-HEARING SUBMISSIONS.	0.20	32.00
4/26/2017	ВММ	REVISE POST-HEARING SUBMISSION AND FILE WITH HEARING OFFICER.	4.50	720.00
4/27/2017	ВММ	REVIEW EMPLOYEES POST-HEARING STATEMENT; EXCHANGE E-MAILS WITH HEARING OFFICER AS TO DELIVERY OF REPORT TO TOWN ADMINISTRATOR.	0.40	64.00
4/28/2017	MZK	RECEIVE POST-HEARING SUBMISSION FROM LIEUTENANT'S COUNSEL; REVIEW AND SEND TO TOWN ADMINISTRATOR; SEND EXHIBITS TO TOWN ADMINISTRATOR.	0.50	80.00
		SUBTOTAL:	50.00	8,000.00
COPPERSMI	TH WAY			
4/4/2017	AEK	COPPERSMITH WAY - REVIEW COMPREHENSIVE PERMIT DECISIONS TO DETERMINE RESPONSIBILITY OF COMPLETING ROADWAYS.	1.20	192.00
4/5/2017	KLK	ANALYZE COMPREHENSIVE PERMIT RE: OBLIGATION TO COMPLETE ROADS.	0.20	32.00
4/6/2017	KLK	ANALYZE ISSUES RE: ESCROW MONIES AND RESERVATION OF RIGHTS IN PROPOSED LETTER FROM ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS TO FIDELITY BANK.	0.20	32.00
4/7/2017	KLK	ANALYSIS OF REQUEST FOR SECURED FUNDS HELD BY FIDELITY BANK.	0.30	48.00
4/7/2017	A EK	DETERMINE PROCEDURE TO COLLECT BOND FUNDS FOR COMPLETION OF WAY.	0.30	48.00
		SUBTOTAL:	2.20	352.00
KING V. TOW	N CLERK,	ET A L.		
4/4/2017	BWR	DRAFT NOTICE OF APPEARANCE; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: RECALL ELECTIONS.	0.30	48.00
4/5/2017	BWR	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO TOWN CLERK RE: STATUS OF LITIGATION, STRATEGY FOR PRELIMINARY	0.70	112.00

INJUNCTION HEARING.

4/10/2017	BWR	LEGAL RESEARCH AND ANALYSIS RE: ELECTION RELATED CASE LAW; REVIEW CASE FILE; DRAFT MEMORANDUM IN OPPOSITION TO PRELIMINARY INJUNCTION TO PREVENT RECALL ELECTION; DRAFT AFFIDAVIT OF TOWN CLERK.	6.00	960.00
4/11/2017	BWR	REVIEW FILE DOCUMENTS AND MEMORANDUM IN OPPOSITION TO PRELIMINARY INJUNCTION FILED BY NON-MUNICIPAL DEFENDANTS.	0.80	128.00
4/13/2017	BWR	PREPARE FOR AND REPRESENT TOWN CLERK AND BOARD OF VOTER REGISTRARS AT PLAINTIFF'S PRELIMINARY INJUNCTION HEARING AT LOWELL SUPERIOR COURT.	4.90	784.00
4/20/2017	BWR	REVIEW COURT DECISION DENYING PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR PRELIMINARY INJUNCTION; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO TOWN RE:SAME AND RECALL ELECTION PROCEDURES.	1.00	160.00

		SUBTOTAL:	13.70	2,192.00
		TOTAL:	129.70	20,752.00

A CCUMULATED DISBURSEMENTS AT COST; DEPOSITION FEE, REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRESS MAIL, SPECIAL POSTAGE, TOLL CALLS AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.

TOTAL COSTS:

1,199.48

TOTAL DUE:

\$ 21,951.48

KP LAW, P.C. 101 ARCH STREET BOSTON, MA 02110 (617) 556-0007

INVOICE NO. 112343

BOARD OF SELECTMEN TOWNSEND TOWN HALL 272 MAIN STREET TOWNSEND, MA 01469

JUNE 16, 2017

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH May 31, 2017

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES						
5/1/2017	BWR	RESEARCH AND DRAFT OPINION LETTER TO PLANNING DIRECTOR RE: REVIEW AND APPROVAL OF ZONING BY-LAW AMENDMENTS ON ANNUAL TOWN MEETING WARRANT	2.10	336.00		
5/2/2017	BWR	MEET WITH SELECTMAN LISIO RE: STATUS OF PENDING MATTERS; PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND ANNUAL TOWN MEETING.	8.00	1,280.00		
5/8/2017	JBB	PLANNING BOARD/TROPHY A VENUE - REVIEW PREVIOUS DECISIONS AND PLANS AND REVISE MEMORANDUM RE: CHRONOLOGY AND CONCLUSIONS.	0.60	96.00		
5/9/2017	SEM	REVIEW AND ANALYZE CONTRACT AND BOND DOCUMENTS; DRAFT AND SEND LETTER APPROVING AS TO FORM.	1.10	176.00		
5/9/2017	BW R	REVIEW MOTIONS AND DRAFT REVISION TO CAPITAL PROJECT MOTION AND SEND TO TOWN A DMINISTRATOR; PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND 5/9 ANNUAL TOWN MEETING	7.00	1.120.00		
5/10/2017	JBB	PLANNING BOARD/TROPHY A VENUE - REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM BOARD ADMINISTRATOR RE: RECENT BOARD ACTION AND STATUS OF MATTER.	0.20	32.00		
5/11/2017	LFG	RECALL - CONSIDER FACTS AND LEGAL ISSUES RE: TIMING OF ELECTION AND POSSIBLE CONFLICT OF INTEREST MATTERS.	0.20	32.00		
5/11/2017	KRG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE SPECIAL ELECTION QUESTION.	0.50	80.00		
5/17/2017	JBB	CONSERVATION COMMISSION /TROPHY ROAD - REVIEW VOICEMAIL MESSAGE FROM CHAIRMAN RE: PENDING APPLICATION AND QUESTION RE: SEQUENCE WITH PLANNING BOARD; LEGAL RESEARCH RE: A BILITY TO DELAY REVIEW UNTIL AFTER SPECIAL PERMIT IS A MENDED; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH	1.00	160.00		

		CONSERVATION COMMISSION CHAIRMAN RE: FACTS AND ADVICE.		
5/17/2017	JC	REVIEW RULES FOR FILING OPPOSITION TO SINGLE JUSTICE PETITION.	0.10	16.00
5/17/2017	AEK	CONSERVATION COMMISSION - TROPHY ROAD SPECIAL PERMIT - REVIEW QUESTION RE: PLANNING BOARD MODIFICATION AND NOI MOVING FORW ARD.	0.30	48.00
5/24/2017	BWR	REVIEW NEW SUIT FILED BY PINE RIDGE CONDO TRUSTEES (BIJJANI).	0.40	64.00
5/30/2017	BWR	REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND PLEADINGS RECEIVED FROM NASHOBA HEALTH DEPARTMENT RE: STATUS OF 122 SOUTH ROW ROAD.	0.40	64.00
		SUBTOTAL:	21.90	3,504.00
GENERA L LA	ABOR SERV		21.70	3,304.00
CE. CHOTE E	IDON SERV			
5/1/2017	DCJ	POLICE - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH POLICE CHIEF REGARDING SUBPOENA COMPLIANCE.	0.50	80.00
5/4/2017	DCJ	POLICE - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN A DMINISTRATOR REGARDING RELEASE OF CONFIDENTIAL INFORMATION RECEIVED FROM NEARBY COMMUNITY.	0.30	48.00
5/5/2017	DCJ	POLICE - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN A DMINISTRATOR REGARDING RELEASE OF POLICE REPORT; REVIEW EMAIL FROM TOWN A DMINISTRATOR REGARDING RELEASE OF REPORT; CONFERENCE CALL WITH TOWN A DMINISTRATOR AND INTERIM POLICE CHIEF.	0.60	96.00
5/5/2017	DCJ	POLICE - DRAFT EMAIL TO TOWN ADMINISTRATOR REGARDING COMPUTER SEARCH REQUEST, REVIEW RESPONSE.	0.10	16.00
5/8/2017	DCJ	POLICE - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN A DMINISTRATOR REGARDING GENERAL STATUS.	0.10	16.00
5/12/2017	DCJ	LT-TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN A DMINISTRATOR REGARDING STATUS OF EXECUTIVE SESSION.	0.10	16.00
5/22/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL REGARDING PRIVACY CLAIM A GAINST TOWN.	0.20	32.00
5/22/2017	DCJ	WATER - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN ADMINISTRATOR REGARDING UNIT COMPOSITION ISSUES.	0.20	32.00

			*********	***************************************
		SUBTOTAL:	2.10	336.00
CABLETV				
5/22/2017	WH	REVIEW AND REPLY TO FURTHER E-MAIL FROM CABLE CHAIR RE: BUILD-OUT ISSUES WITH COMCAST.	0.30	48.00
5/23/2017	WH	REVIEW LICENSE AND E-MAILS FROM CABLE ADVISORY COMMITTEE CHAIR; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CABLE ADVISORY COMMITTEE CHAIR RE: PROBLEMS GETTING LICENSEE TO COOPERATE WITH POWER COMPANY TO COORDINATE LINE EXTENSION; EVALUATE SAME; REVIEW AND EVALUATE ENFORCEMENT OPTIONS.	0.70	112.00
5/26/2017	WH	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COMCAST REPRESENTATIVE RE: BUILD-OUT ISSUES.	0.20	32.00
		SUBTOTAL:	1.20	192.00
TRUSTEES O	F PINE RID	GE CONDO TRUST V. COVIELLO AND TOWNSEND		
5/17/2017	BWR	REVIEW FILE DOCUMENTS AND DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO TREASURER RE: STATUS OF LIEN.	0.40	64.00
5/26/2017	BWR	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: STATUS OF TOWN'S LIEN AND LITIGATION, POTENTIAL RESOLUTION.	0.50	80.00
		SUBTOTAL:	0.90	144.00
POLICE CHIE	F EATON			
5/1/2017	MZK	DRAFT NOTICE OF TERMINATION FOR POLICE CHIEF.	3.00	480.00
5/2/2017	MZK	SEND DRAFT NOTICE OF TERMINATION TO TOWN ADMINISTRATOR.	0.10	16.00
5/3/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH UNION REGARDING STATUS OF VOTES.	0.10	16.00
5/4/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN A DMINISTRATOR REGARDING NOTICE OF TERMINATION AND RELATED ISSUES.	0.30	48.00
5/4/2017	DCJ	WORK ON NOTICE OF TERMINATION.	0.30	48.00
5/4/2017	MZK	EDIT TERMINATION LETTER AND FINDINGS OF FACT.	1.80	288.00

KP LAW, P.C. PA GE: 4

5/5/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN A DMINISTRATOR REGARDING TERMINATION NOTICE.	0.20	32.00
5/8/2017	DCJ	REVIEW MATTER OF TERMINATION RECEIVED FROM TOWN ADMINISTRATOR.	0.10	16.00
5/11/2017	DCJ	REVIEW REVISED LETTER OF TERMINATION.	0.10	16.00
		SUBTOTAL:	6.00	960.00
POLICE/GIAN	NCOTTI/DI:	SC.		
5/4/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHAIR REGARDING STATUS OF DECISION.	0.10	16.00
5/4/2017	ВММ	REVIEW HEARING OFFICERS REPORT AND RECOMMENDATION FOR DISCIPLINE.	0.30	48.00
5/9/2017	DCJ	REVIEW EMAIL FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL REQUESTING REPORT; FORWARD TO TOWN ADMINISTRATOR.	0.10	16.00
5/19/2017	DCJ	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM OPPOSING COUNSEL REGARDING BOARD OF SELECTMEN MEETING; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL REGARDING SAME.	0.30	48.00
5/22/2017	DCJ	DT - REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM BOARD OF SELECTMEN MEMBER REGARDING ACCEPTANCE OF REPORT.	0.40	64.00
5/22/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BOARD OF SELECTMEN MEMBER REGARDING HEARING PROCEDURE.	0.30	48.00
5/22/2017	DCJ	SEVERAL TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH TOWN A DMINISTRATOR REGARDING HEARING PROCEDURES.	0.30	48.00
5/23/2017	DCJ	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM BOARD OF SELECTMEN MEMBER REGARDING REVIEW OF HEARING OFFICER REPORT.	0.20	32.00
5/24/2017	DCJ	REVIEW EMAIL FROM TOWN ADMINISTRATOR WITH NOTICE OF EXECUTIVE SESSION.	0.10	16.00
5/26/2017	DCJ	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO TWO EMAILS FROM TOWN ADMINISTRATOR REGARDING INVESTIGATION REPORT.	0.10	16.00
5/26/2017	DCJ	REVIEW INVESTIGATOR REPORT AND HEARING OFFICER REPORT IN PREPARATION FOR DISCIPLINE HEARING.	1.50	240.00
5/26/2017	BMM	EXCHANGE E-MAILS WITH TOWN ADMINISTRATOR RE:	0.20	32.00

		EXHIBITS ENTERED AT HEARING FOR PUBLIC SAFETY EMPLOYEE.		
5/30/2017	DCJ	PREPARE FOR AND REPRESENT TOWN AT DISCIPLINE HEARING.	3.50	560.00
		SUBTOTAL:	7.40	1,184.00
KING V. TOW	N CLERK,	ET A L.		
5/5/2017	BWR	REVIEW CASE STATUS AND DRAFT ANSWER TO COMPLAINT.	0.50	80.00
5/18/2017	BWR	REVIEW SINGLE JUSTICE APPEAL FILED BY PLAINTIFF; REVIEW COURT RULES FOR APPEAL; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO TOWN CLERK, TOWN ADMINISTRATOR RE: SINGLE JUSTICE APPEAL.	1.40	224.00
5/24/2017	BWR	PREPARE MEMORANDUM IN OPPOSITION TO PLAINTIFF'S SINGLE JUSTICE APPEAL AND DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO COURT FILING SAME.	1.20	192.00
		SUBTOTAL:	3.10	496.00
CONTRACTS				
5/24/2017	RTH	W A TER TANK PROJECT - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH W A TER SUPERINTENDENT RE: PERFORM ANCE AND PAYMENT BONDS.	0.10	16.00
		SUBTOTAL:	0.10	16.00
		TOTAL:	42.70	6,832.00
		RSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPREAND ON-LINE RESEARCH.	ESS MAIL, SP	ECIAL
		TOTAL COSTS:		474.01
		TOTAL DUE:		7,306.01

101 A RCH STREET BOSTON, MA 02110 (617) 556-0007

INVOICE NO. 112704

BOARD OF SELECTMEN TOWNSEND TOWN HALL 272 MAIN STREET TOWNSEND, MA 01469

JUNE 30, 2017

IN REFERENCE TO: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH June 30, 2017

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

6/2/2017	BWR	OPEN MEETING LAW - ANALYZE FACTS AND LEGAL ISSUES RE: A PPLICATION OF LAW TO CORRESPONDENCE BETWEEN TOWN A DMINISTRATOR AND BOARD OF SELECTMEN MEMBERS.	0.80	128.00
6/6/2017	DCJ	NOTICE CLAIM - REVIEW EMAIL FROM COUNSEL WITH NOTICE OF CLAIM; FORWARD TO TOWN ADMINISTRATOR ADVISING TO SEND TO INSURER.	0.10	16.00
6/13/2017	DWW	BOARD OF HEALTH - REVIEW E-MAIL AND DOCUMENTS FROM DISTRICT SANITARIAN RE: SANITARY CODE VIOLATIONS AT 122 SOUTH ROW ROAD; LEAVE VOICEMAIL FOR DISTRICT SANITARIAN REQUESTING TELEPHONE CONFERENCE TO DISCUSS DOCUMENTS; REVIEW E-MAIL FROM HEALTH AGENT RE: STATUS OF ANALYSIS OF ENFORCEMENT OPTIONS.	0.70	112.00
6/14/2017	DWW	- RESEARCH SANITARY CODE AND G.L C. 127 RE: OPTIONS FOR BOARD OF HEALTH TO ENFORCE VIOLATIONS OF SANITARY CODE; DRAFT RESPONSE TO DISTRICT SANITARIAN.	2.10	336.00
6/19/2017	DWW	PREVIEW VOICEMAIL FROM DISTRICT SANITARIAN RE: ENFORCEMENT OF PRELIMINARY INJUNCTION AGAINST OWNER OF 122 SOUTH ROW ROAD.	0.10	16.00
6/20/2017	SEM	DCAMM WAIVER - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WATER SUPERINTENDENT REGARDING BRIDGE REPLACEMENT AND ISSUES RELATED THERETO; DRAFT PROPOSED EDITS TO EMERGENCY DCAMM WAIVER AND E-MAIL TO WATER SUPERINTENDENT.	2.10	336.00
6/20/2017	DWW	- TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DISTRICT SANITARIAN RE: OPTIONS FOR ENFORCEMENT OF PRELIMINARY INJUNCTION FOR SANITARY CODE VIOLATIONS; CONTINUE RESEARCHING SANITARY CODE TO DETERMINE LEGAL OPTIONS TO ENFORCE PRELIMINARY INJUNCTION; E-MAIL DISTRICT SANITARIAN RE: ISSUES.	1.10	176.00

PAGE: 2

6/21/2017	DW II	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM HEALTH A GENT CONFIRMING RECEIPT OF OPINION RE: OPTIONS FOR ENFORCEMENT OF SANITARY CODE VIOLATIONS; REVIEW E-MAIL FROM DISTRICT SANITARIAN RE: DISCUSSION OF ENFORCEMENT OPTIONS AT UPCOMING BOARD OF HEALTH HEARING.	0.20	32.00	
		SUBTOTAL:	7.20	1,152.00	
GENERAL I	LA BOR SE	RVICES			
6/5/2017	DCJ	POLICE - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN ADMINISTRATOR RE: STATUS OF INVESTIGATION.	0.20	32.00	
6/7/2017	DCJ	POLICE - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH EMPLOYEE COUNSEL RE: CLAIM TO BE FILED; DRAFT EMAIL TO TOWN ADMINISTRATOR ADVISING OF STATUS.	0.20	32.00	
6/9/2017	DCJ	TOWN HALL - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN ADMINISTRATOR RE: CITIZEN COMPLAINT.	0.20	32.00	
6/14/2017	MZK	MERRILL V. TOWN - GATHER DOCUMENTS FROM DISCIPLINARY HEARING FOR PRODUCTION TO INSURER.	1.20	192.00	
6/15/2017	MZK	MERRILL V. TOWN - PRODUCE DOCUMENTS FROM TERMINATION INVESTIGATION TO INSURER.	2.80	448.00	
6/16/2017	DCJ	MERRILL V. TOWN - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH INSURANCE A DJUSTER RE: NEW CLAIM FILED.	0.80	128.00	
6/16/2017	MZK	MERRILL V. TOWN - PREPARE ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS TO SEND TO INSURER.	0.60	96.00	
6/19/2017	DCJ	POLICE - REVIEW E-MAIL FROM NORTH ATTLEBORO COUNSEL; FORWARD TO TOWN ADMINISTRATOR; REVIEW REPLY.	0.20	32.00	7
6/19/2017	MZK	MERRILL V. TOWN - PREPARE ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS TO SEND TO INSURER.	1.60	256.00	
6/20/2017	DCJ	MERRILL V. TOWN - REVIEW EMAIL FROM TOWN CLERK RE: SERVICE OF SUMMONS AND COMPLAINT; FORWARD TO INSURER.	0.20	32.00	
6/21/2017	DCJ	MERRILL V. TOWN - REVIEW EMAIL FROM INSURER RE: REQUEST FOR INFORMATION; FORWARD TO TOWN ADMINISTRATOR.	0.20	32.00	
6/22/2017	DCJ	MERRILL V. TOWN - TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH INSURANCE ADJUSTER RE: INFORMATION REQUESTED; OBTAIN AND FORWARD REQUESTED DOCUMENTS TO INSURER.	0.50	80.00	

6/23/2	2017 M	POLICE - RECORDS REQUEST - REVIEW AND ANALYZE PUBLIC RECORD REQUEST FOR POLICE DISCIPLINARY MATTER.	1.20 192.00	
6/26/20	017 M.	POLICE - RECORDS REQUEST - SEARCH AND SEGREGATE DOCUMENTS RESPONSIVE TO PUBLIC RECORD REQUEST.	0.3	0 48.00
6/27/20	17 MZ	POLICE - RECORDS REQUEST - SEARCH AND SEGREGATE DOCUMENTS IN RESPONSE TO PUBLIC RECORD REQUEST; DRAFT RESPONSE LETTER RE: SAME.	2.10	336.00
6/27/20	17 MZ	MERRILL V. TOWN - SEARCH AND SEGREGATE DOCUMENTS RE: DISCIPLINARY MATTER PER REQUEST OF INSURER.	0.40	64.00
CABLE T	V	SUBTOTAL:	12.70	2,032.00
6/1/2017	WH	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COMCAST FOR CONTRACT INFORMATION FOR GOVERNMENT AFFAIRS REPRESENTATIVE HAUDLEY HARLINGTON.	0.30	48.00
KING V. TO)WN CLED	SUBTOTAL:	0.30	48.00
	WIN CLER	A, EI AL.		
6/2/2017	BWR	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: A PPEA LS COURT SINGLE JUSTICE TO ISSUE DECISION ENJOINING ELECTION; CONTACT COURT CLERK RE: SAME	0.40	64.00
6/5/2017	JC	REVIEW PROCEDURE FOR FURTHER REVIEW OF SINGLE JUSTICE'S ISSUANCE OF INJUNCTION; EVALUATE OPTIONS FOR TOWN, PLAINTIFF AND CO-DEFENDANTS.	0.70	112.00
6/5/2017	LFG	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN A DMINISTRATOR AND TOWN CLERK; REVIEW STATUS OF MATTER; ANALYZE POSTURE OF ELECTION AND RELATED MATTERS.	1.30	208.00
6/6/2017	JC	REVIEW CO-DEFENDANTS' MOTION FOR STAY AND MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION; EVALUATE TOWN'S POSITION WITH RESPECT TO SAME IN ORDER TO ANALYZE TOWN'S OPTIONS.	1.10	176.00
6/6/2017	LFG	REVIEW FACTS AND LEGAL ISSUES RE: STATUS OF APPEALS AND RELATED MATTERS, INCLUDING TOWN'S OPTIONS WITH RESPECT THERETO; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH TOWN ADMINISTRATOR AND LEGAL RESEARCH RE: OPTIONS; REVIEW SUPREME	1.40	224.00

		JUDICIAL COURT APPEAL DOCUMENTS.		
6/6/2017	KRG	DRAFT NOTICE TO ABSENTEE VOTERS AND PRESS RELEASE (NO CHARGE).	3.80	NO CHARGE
6/7/2017	LFG	REVIEW FACTS AND LEGAL ISSUES RE: STATUS OF MATTER.	0.90	144.00
6/8/2017	LFG	REVIEW NON-MUNICIPAL DEFENDANTS' MOTION AND MEMORANDUM FILED WITH SUPREME JUDICIAL COURT FOR SINGLE JUSTICE APPEAL; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COURT CLERK RE: SAME AND STATUS OF POTENTIAL FOR HEARING.	0.90	144.00
6/8/2017	LFG	REVIEW FILINGS WITH SUPREME JUDICIAL COURT AND ANALYZE FACTS AND LEGAL ISSUES RE: SAME.	0.90	144.00
6/9/2017	LFG	FURTHER REVIEW STATUS OF MATTER; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH TOWN ADMINISTRATOR RE: STATUS OF MATTER AND ROLE OF COUNSEL.	1.30	208.00
6/12/2017	LFG	LEGAL RESEARCH, ANALYZE FACTS AND LEGAL ISSUES, TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DIRECTOR, STATE ELECTIONS DIVISION AND TOWN ADMINISTRATOR RE: POSTING OF WARRANT FOR RECALL ELECTION AND RELATED MATTERS; BEGIN PREPARATION FOR SUPREME JUDICIAL COURT SINGLE JUSTICE HEARING.	1.60	256.00
6/13/2017	LFG	REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S OPPOSITION TO SUPREME JUDICIAL COURT SINGLE JUSTICE PETITION.	0.60	96.00
6/13/2017	LFG	PREPARE FOR SUPREME JUDICIAL COURT SINGLE JUSTICE HEARING; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN MANAGER RE: ISSUES.	2.20	352.00
6/14/2017	LFG	PREPARE FOR AND REPRESENT BOARD OF REGISTRARS AT HEARING BEFORE SINGLE JUSTICE OF SUPREME JUDICIAL COURT.	2.70	432.00
		SUBTOTAL:	19.80	2,560.00
POLICE	ISCIPLI	INE .		
6/6/2017	DCJ	REVIEW AND ANALYZE INTERNAL AFFAIRS REPORT; PREPARE CHRONOLOGY AND WRITTEN LIST; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN ADMINISTRATOR AND POLICE CHIEF; DRAFT NOTICE OF HEARING.	2.00	320.00
6/6/2017	MZK	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: CIVIL SERVICE DECISIONS ABOUT DISSEMINATION OF CONFIDENTIAL INFORMATION	1.30	208.00

DISSEMINATION OF CONFIDENTIAL INFORMATION.

*** **** ** ***

6/7/2017	DCJ	DRAFT EMAIL TO TOWN ADMINISTRATOR AND CHIEF RE: RANGE OF DISCIPLINE AND DRAFT NOTICE OF HEARING.	0.20	32.00
6/7/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN A DMINISTRATOR AND CHIEF RE: INTERNAL AFFAIRS REPORT.	0.50	80.00
6/9/2017	DCJ	SEVERAL TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH UNION REPRESENTATIVE AND INVESTIGATOR; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH INVESTIGATOR; REVIEW THREE EMAILS FROM INVESTIGATOR RE: INTERVIEW; DRAFT EMAILS TO UNION REPRESENTATIVE RE: TRANSCRIPTS; REVIEW RESPONSE.	0.50	80.00
6/12/2017	DCJ	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM UNION ATTORNEY RE: INFORMATION REQUEST.	0.10	16.00
6/12/2017	DCJ	REVIEW EMAIL FROM UNION REPRESENTATIVE RE: EXECUTIVE SESSION; FORWARD TO TOWN ADMINISTRATOR; REVIEW RESPONSE.	0.20	32.00
6/13/2017	DCJ	PREPARE FOR AND REPRESENT TOWN AT EXECUTIVE SESSION.	4.50	720.00
6/14/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN ADMINISTRATOR RE: PREPARATION OF CHARGE LETTER.	0.30	48.00
6/14/2017	MZK	LEGAL RESEARCH RE: 150E INFORMATION REQUEST FOR INVESTIGATOR'S REPORT.	1.00	160.00
6/15/2017	DCJ	SEVERAL TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH TOWN A DMINISTRATOR RE: HEARING AND PRODUCTION OF REQUESTED INFORMATION; TWO TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH UNION REPRESENTATIVE RE: INFORMATION REQUEST; DRAFT E-MAILS TO UNION FORWARDING CHARGE LETTER.	0.40	64.00
6/15/2017	DCJ	OBTAIN WITNESS STATEMENTS AND DOCUMENT REQUESTS; FORWARD TO UNION REPRESENTATIVE.	0.30	48.00
6/16/2017	MZK	DRAFT SUBPOENAS FOR HEARING; DRAFT LAST CHANCE A GREEMENT; REQUEST VIDEO OF INCIDENT.	3.60	576.00
6/19/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN A DMINISTRATOR RE: STATUS OF HEARING.	0.20	32.00
6/20/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH UNION ATTORNEY RE: SETTLEMENT OFFER.	0.20	32.00
6/20/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN ADMINISTRATOR AND POLICE CHIEF RE: PREPARATION	0.20	32.00

M LANT, I.C.

FOR HEARING.

		TO THE THIRD.		
6/20/201	17 DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH UNION REPRESENTATIVE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN A DMINISTRATOR; EXCHANGE E-MAILS WITH TOWN A DMINISTRATOR RE: HEARING AND SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL.	0.40	64.00
6/20/201	7 MZK	REVIEW AND EDIT TAPE TRANSCRIPTIONS.	0.90	144.00
6/21/201	7 DCJ	DRAFT E-MAIL TO UNION REPRESENTATIVE RE: SETTLEMENT OFFER; REVIEW RESPONSE OF CHIEF.	0.20	32.00
6/21/2017	DCJ	DRAFT EMAIL TO TOWN ADMINISTRATOR AND POLICE CHIEF ENCLOSING INTERVIEW TRANSCRIPTS.	0.10	16.00
6/21/2017	DCJ	PREPARE MOTION AND FORWARD BOARD OF SELECTMEN; FORWARD TO TOWN ADMINISTRATOR.	0.40	64.00
6/21/2017	DCJ	PREPARE FOR AND REPRESENT TOWN AT DISCIPLINE HEARING.	6.50	1,040.00
6/22/2017	DCJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN ADMINISTRATOR RE: STATUS.	0.20	32.00
CLADKY	FOWNERS	SUBTOTAL:	24.20	3,872.00
CLARK V.	I OW NSENI	D TOWN CLERK, ET AL.		
6/12/2017	LFG	REVIEW PLEADINGS AND RELATED MATTERS IN PREPARATION FOR 6/15/17 SUPERIOR COURT HEARING.	0.30	48.00
6/12/2017	BWR	REVIEW ONLINE COURT DOCKET RE: COMPLAINT FILED, CONTACT INFORMATION FOR OPPOSING COUNSEL, PRELIMINARY INJUNCTION HEARING SCHEDULED FOR 6/15 IN WOBURN.	0.50	80.00
6/12/2017	BWR	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR PLAINTIFF RE: OBTAINING PLEADINGS; REVIEW PLEADINGS FILED AND MOTION FOR PRELIMINARY INJUNCTION.	1.70	272.00
6/14/2017	JC	REVIEW COMPLAINT AND MOTION FOR PRELIMINARY INJUNCTION; REVIEW PLEADINGS AND COURT DECISIONS IN KING RECALL ACTION; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN CLERK RE: ELECTION MATTERS; EVALUATE HOW TOWN'S INTEREST IN ENSURING ORDERLY ELECTION PROCESS ARE IMPLICATED BY REQUESTED RELIEF; EVALUATE RECALL ACT.	2.70	432.00

				, , , (
		CONFERENCES WITH TOWN CLERK AND TOWN ADMINISTRATOR RE: STATUS OF MATTER AND IMPLICATIONS THEREOF.		
6/15/2017	1C	PREPARE LETTER TO COURT RE: DECISIONS IN KING MATTER AND VERSION OF RECALL ACT; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLERK RE: SAME; IDENTIFY TIMELINE OF EVENTS WITH RESPECT TO RECALL; PREPARE FOR HEARING ON MOTION FOR PRELIMINARY INJUNCTION.	2.40	384.00
6/15/2017	JC	ATTEND HEARING ON MOTION FOR PRELIMINARY INJUNCTION IN WOBURN SUPERIOR COURT.	4.50	720.00
6/15/2017	LFG	PREPARE FOR AND ANALYZE RESULTS OF SUPERIOR COURT HEARING; DRAFT LETTER TO COURT FILING VARIOUS RELEVANT DOCUMENTS.	0.90	144.00
6/16/2017	JC	REVIEW PROCEEDINGS AT PRELIMINARY INJUNCTION HEARING; COMMUNICATIONS WITH COURT AND OPPOSING COUNSEL RE: STATUS OF DECISION; OBTAIN DECISION.	0.90	144.00
6/16/2017	LFG	REVIEW FACTS AND LEGAL ISSUES RE: STATUS OF COURT'S ACTION ON INJUNCTION; REVIEW DECISION AND FORWARD TO TOWN ADMINISTRATOR AND TOWN CLERK; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TOWN ADMINISTRATOR RE: DECISION.	0.50	80.00
6/19/2017	JC	REVIEW REVISED INJUNCTION AND FORWARD TO TOWN.	0.10	16.00
		SUBTOTAL:	16.70	2,672.00
ACCUMULAT POSTAGE, TO	ED DISBU LL CALLS	TOTAL: URSEMENTS AT COST; REPRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS, EXPRE AND ON-LINE RESEARCH.	80.90 ESS MAIL, SPEC	12,336.00 CIAL
		TOTAL COSTS:		
				286.60
		TOTAL DUE:	\$	12,622.60
			_	